



DAVISS COUNTY FISCAL COURT

BID #: 14-2019

BID EVALUATION REPORT

KRS 61.876; Operating Policies: Chapter 8; Public Records

Documents submitted in the bid process are a matter of public record. A tabulation of the bid is provided – copies of original documents can be provided upon request.

BID ITEM: **CRUSHED LIMESTONE (ANNUAL)**
 BID OPENING: 05/16/2019
 COURT DATE: 06/06/2019

Daviess County Fiscal Court solicited bids for a qualified supplier to provide crushed limestone, river gravel and sand for the Daviess County Road Department and the West Daviess County Landfill.

Type	Unit	Participants		Current Rates		Current Rates	
		Yager Materials		Picked Up	Inc (Dec)	Delivered	Inc (Dec)
		Picked Up	Delivered				
#11 Washed	per ton	\$16.60	\$21.35	\$16.00	3.8%	\$20.75	2.9%
#8 Washed	per ton	\$19.00	\$23.75	\$18.40	3.3%	\$23.15	2.6%
#8	per ton	\$17.50	\$22.25	\$16.90	3.6%	\$21.65	2.8%
#6	per ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0%	No Bid	0%
#3	per ton	\$15.40	\$20.15	\$14.80	4.1%	\$19.55	3.1%
#610	per ton	\$15.40	\$20.15	\$14.80	4.1%	\$19.55	3.1%
#57	per ton	\$15.40	\$20.15	\$14.80	4.1%	\$19.55	3.1%
DGA	per ton	\$15.40	\$20.15	\$14.80	4.1%	\$19.55	3.1%
Rip-Rap	per ton	\$17.60	\$22.35	\$17.00	3.5%	\$21.75	2.8%
Fill Gravel	per ton	\$14.85	\$19.60	\$14.85	0%	\$19.60	0%
Pea Gravel	per ton	\$14.85	\$19.60	\$14.85	0%	\$19.60	0%
River Sand	per ton	\$11.30	\$16.05	\$10.80	4.6%	\$15.55	3.2%

Notes: Projected increases (decreases) are based off the recommendation detailed below.

Recommendation: Yager Materials

Daviess County Fiscal Court received one (1) bid. Yager Materials is the only bid received, having no exceptions to the bid specifications. It is our recommendation to award Bid No. 14-2019 to Yager Materials for the respective schedule of rates above for the contract period extending from July 1st, 2019 to June 30th, 2020.

Respectfully,

Jordan Johnson, Purchasing
 Mark Brasher, Director of Public Works; County Engineer
 Robbie Hocker, Department Head of Solid Waste