



# Daviss County Fiscal Court

Bid No. 13-2019 Tabulation

Unit	Type	Participants										Current Rates	Inc (Dec)
		Utility Pipe Sales		Consolidated Pipe		St. Regis Culvert*		Metal Culverts*		Hagan & Stone			
		Pipe	Bands	Pipe	Bands	Pipe	Bands	Pipe	Bands	Pipe	Bands		
12"/16	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.65	\$36.65	\$9.97	\$19.94	\$12.70	\$25.40	\$12.70	0.0%
15"/16	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.58	\$43.95	\$12.54	\$25.08	\$14.55	\$29.10	\$15.25	-4.6%
18"/16	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.98	\$54.95	\$14.90	\$29.80	\$18.20	\$36.40	\$19.05	-4.5%
24"/14	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.16	\$87.90	\$24.42	\$48.84	\$29.15	\$58.30	\$30.05	-3.0%
30"/14	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$43.95	\$109.87	\$29.98	\$59.96	\$36.40	\$72.80	\$37.58	-3.1%
36"/14	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$52.74	\$131.85	\$35.75	\$71.50	\$43.70	\$87.40	\$45.10	-3.1%
42"/12	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$96.22	\$240.50	\$57.13	\$114.26	\$69.20	\$138.40	\$71.40	-3.1%
48"/12	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$109.75	\$274.38	\$65.08	\$130.16	\$78.90	\$157.80	\$81.70	-3.4%
60"/10	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$173.86	\$434.65	\$104.41	\$208.82	\$124.95	\$249.90	\$129.00	-3.1%
17"x13"/16	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$25.80	\$64.50	\$13.44	\$26.88	\$15.65	\$31.30	\$16.95	-7.7%
21"x15"/16	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.25	\$80.63	\$15.79	\$31.58	\$19.55	\$39.10	\$21.20	-7.8%
24"x18"/16	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$36.55	\$91.40	\$18.37	\$36.74	\$22.15	\$44.30	\$27.45	-19.3%
28"x20"/14	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$59.16	\$147.88	\$25.72	\$51.44	\$31.30	\$62.60	\$33.40	-6.3%
35"x24"/14	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$73.90	\$184.73	\$31.28	\$62.56	\$39.15	\$78.30	\$41.75	-6.2%
42"x29"/12	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$131.19	\$327.98	\$50.24	\$100.48	\$63.95	\$127.90	\$68.20	-6.2%
49"x33"/12	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$152.61	\$381.53	\$58.83	\$117.66	\$74.35	\$148.70	\$79.35	-6.3%
57"x38"/12	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$174.02	\$435.05	\$66.89	\$133.78	\$84.80	\$169.60	\$90.50	-6.3%
65"x40"/12	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$246.20	\$615.50	\$76.21	\$152.42	\$95.25	\$190.50	\$101.60	-6.2%
72"x44"/12	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$100.12	\$200.24	\$123.65	\$247.30	\$143.35	-13.7%
95"x67"/10	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$470.68	\$1,176.70	\$177.93	\$355.86	\$219.80	\$439.60	\$230.50	-4.6%
103"x71"/10	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$502.25	\$1,255.62	\$190.92	\$381.84	\$235.10	\$470.20	\$246.50	-4.6%
112"x75"/8	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$250.97	\$501.94	\$279.50	\$559.00	\$352.40	-20.7%
128"x83"/8	Corrugated Steel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$282.94	\$565.88	\$312.00	\$624.00	\$395.70	-21.2%
12"N12	Polyethylene	\$5.31	\$6.70	\$4.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.20	\$20.50	\$6.20	0.0%
15"N12	Polyethylene	\$7.11	\$11.13	\$6.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.25	\$34.20	\$8.25	0.0%
18"N12	Polyethylene	\$9.06	\$18.97	\$8.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.00	\$41.00	\$11.00	0.0%
24"N12	Polyethylene	\$16.34	\$26.75	\$15.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.45	\$68.35	\$19.45	0.0%
36"N12	Polyethylene	\$30.69	No Bid	\$27.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.80	\$209.05	\$35.80	0.0%

\*Companies bid Polymer Coated Pipe in exception to the specified Corrugated Steel Tar-Coated Pipe.